Registered No. HSE/49. : [Price : Rs.2-00 Paise

e—so@é@é'g TPes (B
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BYAUTHORITY
No. 4] AMARAVATI, TUESDAY, 19t APRIL,  2022. :

ANDHRA- PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Ete., '

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the
assent of the Governor on the 14% April, 2022 and the said assent is hereby first

published on the 19% April, 2022 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general information :

ACT No. 4 of 2022.
AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH PUBLIC
EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION OF AGE OF SUPERANNUATION)
ACT, 1984. : :

: Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the -
Seventy-third Year of the Republic of India as follows,-

1. (1) ThisActmay be called the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation é‘iﬁ&lﬁl&i‘ﬁf
of Age of Superannuation) (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) Itshallbe deemed to have come into force on the 1t January, 2022.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Amendment of
Superannuation) Act, 1984, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in Section3.

section 3,-
Act23 of 1984.
(1) in sub-section(l), for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty two years

shall be substituted.

(2)in sub-section (2), for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

(1]



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY ' [PART IV-B

(3) insub-section (3),-

(@)  forthe words “sixty years", the words “sixty two years” shall be
substituted.

(b)  in Explanation-l], for words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

4)in sub-sectien(4),~

(@ in clause (a), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

(b) in clause (b), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

Amendmentof 3. _In the Principal Act, in section 3A, in sub-section (2),-
section 3A.

(1) for the words “fifty eight years” the words “sixty one years” shall be,
substituted.

(2) for the words “sixty years” wherever it occurs, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

Rep_ealof 4. (1) The Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
95 il Superannuation) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 is hereby repealed.
' (2) Netwithstanding such repeal, anything done or eny action taken-
under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or

taken under this Act.

VADDADI SUNITHA,
Secretary to Government (FAC),
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press, Amaravati.



